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 EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 
THIS REPORT PROVIDES AN OVERVIEW OF THE WASHINGTON STATE 
INSTITUTIONAL REVIEW BOARD.  IT SUMMARIZES THE BOARD'S AUTHORITY 
AND FUNCTIONS, OUTLINES THE HUMAN RESEARCH REVIEW PROCESS, AND 
DESCRIBES MAJOR ACTIVITIES DURING FISCAL YEAR 2004.  IT ALSO 
INCLUDES A LOG OF ALL RESEARCH PROJECTS WHICH WERE REVIEWED 
DURING THIS PERIOD. 
 
Under Federalwide Assurances with the Department of Health and Human Services, the 
Washington State Institutional Review Board reviews and approves research (except 
exempted categories) sponsored by the Department of Social and Health Services (DSHS), 
the Department of Health (DOH), or the Department of Labor and Industries (L&I), 
conducted by or under the direction of any employee of agent of these state agencies, 
using any DSHS, DOH, or L&I property or facility, or using any non-public information held 
by these state agencies to identify or contact human research subjects or prospective 
subjects.  
 
The review process is intended to protect the rights and welfare of subjects participating in 
the research, and to assure that the research is sound and is likely to produce benefits 
which are greater than the risks to subjects.  The review also protects the departments 
from liability resulting from improperly conducted research. 
 
The Washington State Institutional Review Board is comprised of professionals working 
both within and outside these three state agencies.  Each Board has scientist members, 
and members whose primary interests are in non-scientific areas.  Board members 
volunteer a substantial amount of their time to review proposals submitted by researchers. 
 The membership of Review Board A and Review Board B is shown on pages v and vii. 
 
The Review Board receives administrative support from the Human Research Review 
Section in the Department of Social and Health Services.  Staff in the Section also serve as 
the Executive Secretary and Associate Executive Secretary of the Board. 
 
More information about the departments' human research review policies and procedures, 
and copies of the Washington State Agency Policy on Protection of Human Research 
Subjects (revised April 14, 2003), the Washington State Institutional Review Board 
Procedures Manual (April 2004), and the departments' Research Application forms, are 
available on the Review Section’s website: http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/. You may 
contact the Review Section at (360) 902-8075 or by email at: wsirb@dshs.wa.gov.    

http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/
mailto:wsirb@dshs.wa.gov
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ACTIVITY REPORT 
 
 

Department of Social and Health Services 
Department of Health 

Department of Labor and Industries 
 

Washington State Institutional Review Board 
 

Fiscal Year 2005 
 
 

 
I. PURPOSE   
 
The Department of Social and Health Services (DSHS), Department of Health (DOH), and 
Department of Labor and Industries (L&I) are responsible for protecting the rights and 
welfare of clients, employees, and members of the general public who serve as subjects in 
research within the departments' jurisdiction.  DSHS/DOH/L&I have fulfilled this 
responsibility by establishing a formal policy for the protection of human subjects, and by 
supporting a standing Institutional Review Board (IRB) which operates under the auspices 
of Federalwide Assurances (FWAs) with the federal Department of Health and Human 
Services.  The Washington State Institutional Review Board (WSIRB) housed in the 
Department of Social and Health Services is the IRB for the three state agencies. 
 
The WSIRB conducts an ethical and a technical review of proposed research to assure that 
the rights and welfare of subjects are adequately protected, and that risks are minimized, 
are not unreasonable, and are outweighed by potential benefits.  The review also assesses 
whether the proposed design and methods are adequate and appropriate in light of stated 
project objectives. 
 
 
II. AUTHORITY 
 
The departments' human subjects protection policy complies with federal regulations (45 
CFR 46, 45 CFR 164) and with protective requirements of state law (e.g., RCW 42.48; RCW 
70.02).  Washington Administrative Code (WAC 388-10), DSHS Administrative Policy 12.01, 
DOH Administrative Policy 03.001, and L&I Administrative Policy 9.43, prohibit any 
departmental service or administrative unit from allowing the conduct of research and 
related activities until the plans or protocols have been approved by the Review Board.  
The departments' policy is described more fully in the Washington State Agency Policy on 
Protection of Human Research Subjects, revised April 14, 2003, available to download from 
the Review Section website:  http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/.  
 
 
 

http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/
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III. ACTIVITIES SUBJECT TO BOARD REVIEW  
 
Except for research activities specifically exempted in the Washington State Agency Policy 
on Protection of Human Research Subjects, Section XI, the departments' human research 
review policy applies to all research and related activities that are (i) sponsored by 
DSHS/DOH/L&I, (ii) conducted by an employee or agent of DSHS/DOH/L&I, (iii) which use 
any DSHS/DOH/L&I property or facility, or (iv) which involve the use of DSHS/DOH/L&I 
non-public information to identify or contact human research subjects or prospective 
subjects. The policy applies to research and related activities contracted by DSHS/DOH/L&I 
to non-departmental organizations or individuals, regardless of whether the research 
involves department clients or a nondepartmental subject population.   
 
A definition of research and a list of categories of research that are exempt from review 
are provided in the Washington State Agency Policy on Protection of Human Research 
Subjects, Sections IV and XI, respectively.  In addition, Guidelines developed by the 
Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, on the Review Section’s website:  
http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/, are helpful in distinguishing between public health 
research and public health practice.  However, these documents may not always provide 
enough information to distinguish between research and related activities that are subject 
to review and administrative data collection or program monitoring activities that are not 
subject to review.  If in doubt, researchers and program managers should contact Review 
Section staff to determine the boundaries of Review Board jurisdiction.   
 
 
IV. ADMINISTRATION 
 
The DSHS Human Research Review Section is a three-person administrative unit that 
provides staff support to the Review Board, and coordinates and administers the human 
research review policy.  The Section Coordinator and Review Coordinator provide liaison 
between DSHS/DOH/L&I and other agencies and institutions on human subjects protection 
issues.  The Section Coordinator serves as the Executive Secretary of the Review Board, 
the Review Coordinator as the Associate Executive Secretary.   
 
Research proposals requiring Board review must be submitted on the departments' 
application forms.  Research application forms may be downloaded from the Review 
Section’s website. Review Section staff are available to assist researchers in completing 
their applications, and to consult on jurisdictional and policy or procedural questions. 
Department researchers and managers who are unsure of whether a proposed activity 
requires Board review should consult with Review Section staff. 
 
 
V. REVIEW BOARD FUNCTIONS 
 
The primary function of the Washington State Institutional Review Board is to protect the 
interests of individuals participating in research within the departments' jurisdiction.  The 
Review Board performs this function by reviewing proposed research plans, and, if 
necessary, by assisting researchers in revising their plans to conform to accepted ethical 
standards and regulatory requirements.  An important secondary function of the Review 

http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/
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Board is to provide DSHS/DOH/L&I management with the necessary expertise to determine 
whether proposed research is valid, worthwhile, and in compliance with federal and state 
statutes and regulations. DSHS/DOH/L&I administrators, managers, and supervisors are 
encouraged to refer all inquiries regarding human subjects research to the Review Section. 
 
 
VI. REVIEW BOARD MEMBERSHIP 
 
Review Board members are chosen to represent the diversity of programs administered by 
DSHS/DOH/L&I, and to provide the necessary expertise to conduct a thorough ethical and 
technical review of proposed research.  The Review Board is comprised of Board A, a 
general purpose board, and Board B, which specializes in the review of mental health, 
juvenile justice,  and alcohol and substance abuse research, but which reviews other 
research as well.  
 
Each Review Board includes at least two physician members who are licensed to prescribe 
drugs in Washington State and at least one member whose primary interests are in 
nonscientific areas.  The majority of Board members have graduate-level training in 
statistics, research design and methods, and many are employed in scientific research 
positions.  Each Board retains at least one member whose primary interest is in advocating 
for the rights of department clients, patients, or wards.  Although the majority of members 
are department employees, the Board also includes university faculty and representatives 
of the general community who are unencumbered by possible departmental interests.  The 
current membership of Review Board A and Review Board B is listed on pages v and vii. 
 
 
VII. REVIEW PROCESS 
 
Investigators wishing to conduct human subjects research which falls under 
DSHS/DOH/L&I jurisdiction should submit their application to the Review Section. 
Depending on the nature, scope, and complexity of the proposed research, applications are 
either referred to one of the Review Boards for consideration at a regularly scheduled 
meeting, or are reviewed by two or more Board members through the expedited process 
(See Washington State Agency Policy on the Protection of Human Research Subjects, 
Section X for activities that are eligible for expedited review).   
 
Proposals that require full Board review are pre-reviewed before they are placed on the 
agenda of a Board meeting.  An electronic copy of a proposal for full Board review must be 
submitted no later than the application deadline for the meeting.  Researchers will be 
informed of the results of the pre-review no later than one week after the application 
deadline.  Researchers then have one week to either revise their application or submit 
supplemental information as an addendum to their application before the proposal is sent 
to Board members prior to the meeting.  One member is asked to be the “primary 
reviewer” and to present the proposal to the Board at the meeting.  Researchers are asked 
to be available by telephone to provide factual information and to clarify issues during 
review of their proposal at the Board meeting.  Occasionally, the researcher is invited to 
attend the meeting to respond to questions or concerns or to provide supplementary 
information. 
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Prior to discussion of specific research proposals, the Chair asks Review Board members to 
disclose any potential conflicts of interest they may have with items on the meeting 
agenda.  Conflicts of interest may arise for either financial or personal reasons.  Review 
Board members who have a conflicting interest with proposals on the agenda do not 
participate in the Board’s review, except to provide information requested by the Review 
Board. 
 
Members who have a significant conflict of interest recuse themselves from consideration 
of the research proposal and leave the meeting room during discussion and voting.  They 
are not counted in the quorum for consideration of that agenda item.  Members who have 
a less significant conflict of interest may remain in the room during consideration of the 
proposal, but do not participate in the discussion except to answer questions, and abstain 
from the vote.  Members who abstain from voting are counted in the quorum for 
consideration of that item. 
 
The criteria for approval of research are listed in the Washington State Agency Policy on 
the Protection of Human Research Subjects, Section VII.  The Board also uses the WSIRB 
Review Worksheet and the Review Presentation Guide, published by the Review Section 
and posted on the Review Section’s website, as checklists to promote thorough and 
consistent reviews of all research proposals.  
   
Following presentation of the proposal, the primary reviewer is asked for a disposition 
recommendation.  When the motion has been made and seconded, other members are 
invited to share their comments and/or concerns about the proposal with the Board.  The 
disposition motion may be amended or withdrawn on the basis of the additional discussion. 
Final disposition of the proposal is decided by a simple majority vote of all members 
present at the meeting.  The Board may approve the proposal as submitted, approve the 
proposal subject to specified conditions, defer consideration of the proposal pending 
submission of supplemental information, or disapprove the proposal.   
 
Unfavorable review dispositions (i.e., disapproval, restrictions, special approval conditions) 
are binding and not subject to administrative override.  Researchers may appeal 
unfavorable review dispositions directly to the Review Board.  Each proposal approved by 
the Board is subject to administrative review and concurrence by the appropriate 
DSHS/DOH/L&I division director or assistant secretary.  
 
If approved research is to be conducted within departmental offices, institutions, or other 
facilities, the Review Section will provide local administrators with information on Board 
approved procedures, with a request that they supervise the research to ensure that these 
procedures are followed. 
 
The Washington State Institutional Review Board Procedures Manual (April 2004) provides 
additional details regarding the review process, management and support of the Review 
Board, and Review Board operations.  The Manual is available on the Review Section’s 
website at http://www1.dshs.wa.gov/rda/hrrs/. 
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VIII. MAJOR ACTIVITIES:  FISCAL YEAR 2005 
 
Human Subject Protection Activities at the National Level  
 
In February 2005 the federal government settled its case against the University of 
Pennsylvania and the Children’s National Medical Center.  The Justice Department sued 
these institutions for civil fraud in the case of a Jesse Gelsinger, who died as a result of his 
participation in a gene transfer trial in 1999.  In addition to fines of over $500,000 for each 
institution, the researchers were restricted in their conduct of research and receipt of 
federal research funds.  The Principal Investigator was barred from conducting FDA-
sponsored research for five years, and, among other restrictions, was required to have a 
medical monitor oversee all his clinical activities for three years.  
 

Congress 
 
The movement to increase access to both positive and negative results of drug trials 
gained ground, as did the push for a national registry of drug trials.  This development 
follows a lawsuit against GlaxoSmithKline which alleged that the pharmaceutical company 
had hidden the increased risk of suicide among children taking Paxil.  GSK performed five 
trials of the drug in children.  The results of only one of these studies were made available 
to health care providers; the results were ambiguous. As a result of the lawsuit, GSK was 
the first pharmaceutical company to voluntarily create a registry of clinical trials.  In a 
similar move, the American Medical Association requested that HHS implement a national 
registry of all clinical trials currently under way. The AMA plan would require all research 
involving human subjects to be listed in the registry in order to obtain IRB approval. In a 
later development, Rep. Edward Markey presented a bill to Congress that would revise the 
Public Health Service Act to require registration of clinical trials as a condition of federal 
funding.  A companion bill was also introduced into the Senate. 
 
The “Pharmaceutical Research and Manufacturers Accountability Act of 2005” was 
introduced in Congress by representatives Stark, (D-California) and Berry (D-Arkansas).  
The bill, introduced in February 2005, carries severe penalties for failing to disclose 
evidence of serious adverse drug events: a minimum sentence of 20 years to life in prison 
and millions of dollars in fines.  Pharmaceutical company executives would also face stiff 
fines if they failed to submit an annual report of all serious adverse events to the FDA. 
 
Senator Dodd (D-Connecticut) introduced a bill to require registration of all clinical trials--
including trials of experimental devices.  If passed, the requirement for registration would 
apply to all clinical research, regardless of funding source.  The bill would strengthen public 
access to clinical trial data, both positive and negative.  Rather than create a new registry, 
the bill would expand the registry operated by the National Library of Medicine. 
 

Office of Human Research Protections
 
Two new Subparts to the federal human subjects protection regulations, 45 CFR 46, were 
implemented in FY 05.  Subpart F contains requirements for registration of IRBs that 
review research supported by the Department of Health and Human Services or research 
which falls within the jurisdiction of FDA regulations. There is now a single registration 
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system for both agencies, although FDA requirements differ slightly from HHS 
requirements. Subpart E requires that all FWA-institutions ensure that agency officials, IRB 
staff, IRB members, and investigators receive initial and continuing education in the 
requirements for human subjects protection.  The WSIRB has required such training since 
July 2002.  
 
A federally sponsored research protocol was referred by the National Institutes of Mental 
Health IRB to OHRP for a “407 Review”.  An IRB may request a 407 Review when it finds 
that a protocol involving children is “not otherwise approvable which presents an 
opportunity to understand, prevent, or alleviate a serious problem” (45 CFR 46.407).  In 
such cases, the Secretary of HHS convenes a panel to review the protocol and seeks public 
comment, usually by publication of the protocol and request for comment in the Federal 
Register.  The protocol in question proposed to administer a single dose of 
dextroamphetamine to children aged 9-18 years to evaluate brain activity by magnetic 
resonance.  As the study involved healthy controls in addition to children with ADHD, the 
NIMH IRB could not come to agreement regarding the level of risk to child subjects, 
particularly to control subjects.  The protocol was referred to a subcommittee of the FDA 
Pediatric Advisory Committee, which determined that the research was approvable 
provided specific design issues were addressed and modifications were made to the 
research protocol and to the process and documentation of parental permission and child 
assent.  After the Pediatric Ethics Advisory Committee proposed two additional 
modifications and the FDA’s Office of Pediatric Therapeutics endorsed approval, the Acting 
Commissioner granted approval to the protocol in December 2004. 
 
In September 2004 OHRP published “decision trees” for determining requirements for 
human subjects review.  The first in the series leads through the process of determining 
whether an activity is research; subsequent charts lead through decisions as to whether 
human subjects are involved, whether the activity meets federal criteria for exemption, and 
whether the research comprises minimal risk research which qualifies for expedited review.  
The decision trees are available on the OHRP website at http://www.hhs.gov/ohrp/.    
 
OHRP is funding an Institute of Medicine study of participation of prisoners in research.  
The IOM committee, which held its first meeting in March 2005, will consider the ethical 
bases for research with prisoners as opposed to non-prisoners; develop an ethical 
framework for conducting research on prisoners; and identify appropriate safeguards to 
ensure that such research is ethically conducted.  The committee will evaluate whether the 
1976 findings of the National Commission for Protection of Human Subjects in Biomedical 
and Behavioral Research are still relevant to research conducted today, in a changed 
criminal justice and research environment. 
 

National Institutes of Health
 
Financial conflict of interest, particularly at the National Institutes of Health, remains a 
focus of human subjects protection at the national level.  In May 2005, an NIH panel 
submitted a list of recommendations to Director Elias Zerhouni.  Zerhouni, in testimony 
before the House Committee on Energy and Commerce, stated that he would work to 
enhance public trust, increase transparency of internal NIH decisions and procedures 
regarding conflict of interest, and implement ongoing monitoring of financial arrangements 
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between NIH researchers and other entities.  New financial conflict of interest guidelines 
may call for additional disclosures than are currently required.  The guidelines also 
reinforce the prohibition on researchers interacting directly with human subjects if they 
may financially profit from the research results or inventions, and would prohibit senior 
management from receiving consulting fees or other financial perquisites from research 
and/or funding decisions which they oversee as part of their official NIH duties.  
 
In September 2004, NIH proposed a new policy for investigators who receive funds from 
the agency.  The NIH would require researchers to submit a final version of manuscripts 
accepted for publication to the agency, which would then post it on a searchable website.  
The intent is to ensure the public greater access to research that is publicly-funded, and to 
ensure more rapid dissemination of research findings to professional groups and other 
researchers.  The new policy was implemented in May 2005; adherence to the policy is not 
mandatory. 
 
In December 2004, NIH suspended all research on Celebrex and issued a directive to IRBs 
to conduct clinical safety reviews.  This directive follows the cessation of marketing of 
Vioxx due to increased cardiovascular disease risk, and the potential for other Cox-2 
inhibitors to pose similar risks to human subjects of research and patients.  The FDA issued 
related information on the same day, and issued information about the increased risk of CV 
events when taking Celebrex twice per day.  Pfizer ceased direct-to-consumer marketing of 
Celebrex at the request of the FDA.   
 
In December 2004 the NIH issued new guidelines for research involving coded private 
information and/or biological specimens.  The guidance was revised to ensure consistency 
with OHRP guidance on this issue.  Information investigators must provide has been 
incorporated into a new version of Form PHS 398.  These changes apply to new and 
competing continuation grant applications and non-competing continuation reports.  
Additional information is available on the NIH website.  
 

Food and Drug Administration 
 
The FDA issued draft guidance for Investigational New Drug (IND) applications for gene 
transfer trials, to ensure that human subjects are protected.  The guidance appears to be 
another response to the death of Jesse Gelsinger in a gene transfer trial in 1999.  The draft 
guidance is intended to ensure that such trials meet all the regulatory requirements and 
provide sufficient information for the FDA and IRBs to evaluate safety and effectiveness of 
the product. 
 
The FDA also conducted an internal review of conflicts of interest, and issued new 
measures to manage financial conflict of interest.  The FDA will audit outside activities of 
agency employees on a yearly basis; increase the number and type of employees who 
must report potential conflicts; and develop a desk manual regarding conflict of interest for 
agency staff. 
 
An FDA whistleblower, David Graham, M.D., M.P.H., Associate Director for Science and 
Medicine, asserted in Congressional testimony that the FDA itself failed to protect human 
research subjects and patients who had taken Vioxx, as evidence of serious adverse events 



 
 8

had been mounting for five years.  Dr. Graham cited systemic problems within the FDA as 
a primary cause of lapse in the national drug safety network. 
 
The FDA held a public hearing in March 2005 to evaluate adverse event reports and the 
role of IRBs.  With the exponential increase in clinical trials in recent years, many IRBs are 
awash in adverse event reports, sometimes without adequate information to assess risks to 
subjects.  As clinical trials branch out to multi-site and international operations, such 
reports increase in number and complexity.  The public hearing focused on the role of IRBs 
in reviewing reports of adverse events; what kinds of information and information format 
would be helpful to IRBs; and changes to the reporting system to make it more relevant 
and timely for IRBs.  For example, adverse events are often submitted without an 
indication of the drug to which a subject was randomized, without a summary of events 
across study sites, or aggregate statistics which would be helpful in assessing whether the 
adverse event is occurring more frequently, has increased in severity, or is unexpected.  As 
human subjects must be informed of foreseeable risks to research participation, evaluation 
of adverse event reports are key to ensuring ongoing informed consent of subjects, and, in 
some cases, termination of enrollment or of the trial itself. 
 
 
Human Subject Protection Activities at the Local Level  
 
Several Review Board members attained 10 years of service: Board B Chair Robert 
Fineman, M.D., PhD., Medical Consultant at the Department of Health; George Yeannakis, 
J.D., Seattle University School of Law, the Board’s prisoner representative; Robert Mootz, 
D.C., Associate Medical Director for Chiropractic at the Department of Labor and 
Industries; Anna Leon-Guerrero, Ph.D., Associate Professor of Sociology at Pacific Lutheran 
University.  The Review Board and Review Section staff appreciate their dedication to the 
human subjects review process and the care they had taken in reviewing proposals over 
the years.   
 
The Coordinator of the DSHS Human Research Review Section attended the national 
PRIM&R conference October 28-31, 2004 in San Diego.  PRIM&R is Public Responsibility in 
Medicine and Research, and is the preeminent national organization for researchers, IRB 
administrators and IRB members.  The theme of the conference was on how to facilitate 
and improve communication between IRBs and researchers, institutions and study 
sponsors.   A keynote address by Joe Palca, Science Correspondent for National Public 
Radio, was especially enjoyable and entertaining.  Breakout sessions on the implications of 
HIPAA Privacy and Security Rules on research and on distinguishing between research and 
non-research activities were especially helpful.     
 
In February 2005, the Review Section conducted a customer survey to assess quality 
improvement activities.  The web-based anonymous survey was administered to 
researchers who had submitted proposals for review during a four-year period (two years 
before the QI initiative was implemented and two years after implementation).  Links to 
the survey were sent to 198 researchers, of whom 86 responded. Investigators were asked 
to rate the importance of several domains in their work and to rate how well the particular 
domain described the WSIRB.  Overall, of the 86 respondents, 66 gave positive ratings, 10 
were more or less neutral, and 10 were dissatisfied with their experience with the WSIRB.  
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The survey covered timeliness and thoroughness of review; response to investigator 
inquiries; elements of human subjects review such as assessment of risks and benefits, 
knowledge of federal regulations; and communication with and respect for investigators.  
Three open-ended items asked researchers to comment on how the human subjects 
application could be improved (35 comments), what the WSIRB does well (49 comments), 
and what the WSIRB could improve to better meet investigator needs (46 comments).  The 
survey may be repeated in subsequent years, to monitor improvements in client service.      
 
In an effort to reduce costs, streamline operations, and move to electronic reviews, the 
Review Section began sending all materials reviewed under expedited review authority and 
the meeting minutes to Board members in PDF format.  This is in tandem with procedures 
implemented the previous year for initial electronic submission of proposals.  Proposals 
requiring full committee review are administratively pre-reviewed, while expedited reviews 
are forwarded electronically, usually the day of receipt, to Board members for review.  
Construction of a new database for tracking research proposals began in late spring 2005.  
The new database in an Access format will replace the aging Lotus Notes, will automate 
many features for routine reports, and will offer greater adaptability as the Review Section 
enhances its electronic capabilities for human subjects review. 

 
In local IRB news, the University of Washington phased in an electronic IRB review and 
approval system.  The system was implemented by department, with anticipated phase-in 
university-wide in late 2005.  The University of Washington was in the news due to an 
OHRP site visit in February.  Information about the visit is available on the UW Human 
Subjects Division website. 

 
The Review Section began revisions to the human subjects application in February 2005.  
The revised application will be reformatted to check boxes and text fields, which will allow 
investigators to skip portions of the application which are not relevant to their research 
protocol.  The application will also include appendices for research involving protected 
classes of subjects (pregnant women, fetuses and neonates, children, and prisoners), and 
a revised consent form template.  The application will be designed to provide a more user-
friendly format, particularly those sections which appear to be problematic in the current 
application.    
 
The Review Coordinator conducted a series of human subjects protection workshops within 
DSHS Division of Developmental Disabilities residential habilitation centers.  The 
presentations covered the ethical and regulatory framework, WSIRB function, research 
involving records, research involving contact with department clients, and other WSIRB 
requirements.  Lisa Weber, Research Manager in DDD, presented DDD requirements for 
conducting research.  These presentations took place in all RHC’s; DDD management 
required attendance by all clinical staff, supervisors, and social workers.  The Review 
Coordinator also conducted a workshop at the Eastern Washington University School of 
Social Work in April 2005.   
 
Review Section staff also performed outreach to universities in Washington, to explore the 
possibility of streamlining the human subjects review process for investigators.  In April 
2005, staff met with the Research Compliance Officer at Washington State University and 
with School of Social Work administrators at Eastern Washington University.  Discussion 



focused on the feasibility of establishing IRB Authorization Agreements, in which research 
falling under the dual jurisdiction of the WSIRB and the respective universities would be 
reviewed by only one IRB, in most cases by the WSIRB.  In other outreach, the Review 
Coordinator approached the University of Washington School of Public Health regarding the 
possibility of conducting a human subjects protection training for School students and 
faculty.  Further discussion with the Dean of Research will occur in the future. 
 
The Coordinator of the Review Section was a featured speaker at the Northwest 
Association for Biomedical Research social and behavioral sciences conference in Spokane 
in June 2OO5.  The talk focused on WSIRB policies and research involving DSHS clients. 
 
 
IX. REVIEW VOLUME AND TRENDS 
 
Figure 1 provides three measures of Review Board activity during the past 21 years.  The 
number of new research proposals submitted for review increased slowly during the period 
between 1985 and 1990, increased significantly in 1991, and has fluctuated since that time 
while continuing a general upward trend.  
 
A better measure of Review Board workload is the total number of projects reviewed 
during the fiscal year, which includes both initial reviews of new proposals, and annual 
reviews of continuing projects.  The total number of projects reviewed has increased 14% 
during the most recent ten-year period, from 250 in 1996 to 287 in 2005. 

Figure 1 
Review Volume
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Figure 2 shows the distribution of new research proposals by agency and program for 
Fiscal Year 2005.  The Department of Social and Health Services accounted for 53% of the 
new proposals reviewed during FY 2005. Children’s Administration led DSHS program areas 
in the amount of research reviewed with 13% and Juvenile Rehabilitation Administration 
and Medical Assistance Administration each accounting for 10% of new proposals.  About 
41% of the new proposals reviewed were in the jurisdiction of the Department of Health, 
with 20% in Community and Family Health and 13% in Epidemiology and Health Statistics.  
Six percent of the proposals reviewed were in the jurisdiction of the Department of Labor 
and Industries.   
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Figure 3 shows the organizational affiliation of the principal investigators for new research 
proposals received during Fiscal Year 2005.  Almost 45% of the principal investigators were 
university-based, with the University of Washington accounting for the large majority.   
 

 Figure 3 
Researchers Affiliation 
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X. RESEARCH PROPOSALS: FISCAL YEAR 2005 
 
New research proposals reviewed by the Board during Fiscal Year 2005 are listed in 
chronological order of receipt in the Project Log.  These new proposals account for 
approximately one-quarter of the total number of ongoing research projects under the 
Review Board’s jurisdiction at the end of Fiscal Year 2005. 
 
Some examples of typical research conducted in the departments’ jurisdiction are briefly 
described below.  These projects are listed in the Project Log by the date of receipt, which 
is indicated by the numerical component in the Project Code.  Projects discussed below are 
identified by the numerical component of the project code in parentheses. 
 
Several research proposals reviewed during FY05 focused on the criminal justice system 
and programs for individuals who are or may become incarcerated.  This included 
evaluations of family drug courts (B-072504-S), and evaluations of programs for youth on 
parole (B-092804), employment and skill-building programs for juvenile offenders (B-
012605-S), and a mentoring program for youth leaving incarceration (B-061505-S).  Other 
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research in the area of child health and welfare involved children and youth in foster care 
(A-101904-S, B-061005-S, A-061605-S. B-042805-S) or who were adopted (B-030905-S); 
dental health services (A-010705-S); immunizations (A-041805-H); appendicitis (B-011405-
S); children with spina bifida (A-032305-S) and plagiocephaly (A-051305-H). 
 
Graduate students continue to submit research proposals for WSIRB review, in a variety of 
subject areas.  One project focused on an intervention to decrease television viewing 
among low-income children in pre-school ((A-081304-H).  Other student research 
evaluated alcohol- and drug-exposed births to women in substance abuse treatment (A-
011204-S), co-infection with HIV and Hepatitis C (B-011905-H), swallowing function 
among institutionalized mentally retarded persons (B-032805-S), and the lives of young 
children who use medical technology (B-042705-S).  
 
Several research proposals on environmental health were submitted for review during 
FY05.  Two studies evaluated fish consumption and related mercury exposure (A-072804-
H, A-061705-H), while a University of Washington study focused on air pollution and the 
risk of respiratory illness among infants.  Other public health research focused on 
HIV/AIDS (A-121604-H, A-012705-H), trauma patients (A-081204-H, A-110104-H), 
colorectal cancer (A-121704-H), and Salmonella transmission (A-050905-H). 
 
The Department of Labor and Industries submitted proposals regarding a workplace 
occupational health and safety intervention, (A-021505-L), a program to reduce injuries in 
the trucking industry (A-042705-L), and an evaluation of injuries among hospital staff in 
relation to conflicts between work and personal life (A-060105-L).   
 
The Human Research Review Section does not distribute final reports or other research 
products resulting from the studies under review.  Information about the research listed in 
the Project Log, as well as research reports, should be requested directly from the principal 
investigator of each study. 
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PROJECT LOG KEY 
 
 

Project Code 
 
Prefix  Designates Review Board A, Review Board B, or Cooperative Review 

with another IRB 
Number  Designates month, day, and year proposal received 
Suffix  Designates state agency jurisdiction (S=DSHS; H=DOH; L=L&I; 

U=Unaffiliated, C=Cooperative review with another institution) 
 
Program  
 
Department of Social and Health Services 
A&AS/ADSA  Aging and Adult Services/Aging and Disability Services  
CA  Children’s Administration 
DASA  Division of Alcohol and Substance Abuse 
DDD  Division of Developmental Disabilities 
DVR  Division of Vocational Rehabilitation 
ESA  Economic Services Administration 
HRS  Health and Rehabilitative Services Administration 
JRA  Juvenile Rehabilitation Administration 
MAA  Medical Assistance Administration 
MHD  Mental Health Division 
 
Department of Health 
CFH  Community and Family Health  
EHS  Epidemiology, Health Statistics, & Public Health Laboratories 
HSQA  Health Systems Quality Assurance 
EHP  Environmental Health Programs 
 
Department of Labor and Industries 
SHARP  Safety and Health Assessment & Research for Prevention 
PRS  Planning and Research Services   
 
 
Unaffiliated Investigators 
UNA  Research not in jurisdiction of WSIRB; reviewed at investigator request 
 
 
Status  
Ongoing   Project pending final approval, or approved and continuing 
Cancelled  Project was discontinued  
Completed  Project was finished 
Suspended  Project approval suspended 
Exempt  Project was reviewed and found to be outside of the WSIRB 

jurisdiction 
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